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Position paper


Covid-19 first appeared in Wuhan, China in November 2019. Because of its high transmissibility, 
the disease became a pandemic in a short time and the first case in Germany appeared on 
January, 27th.


Since March 13, the outbreak has been managed in the conservation phase according to RKI's 
plan. When there was a quick in number of cases, effective and strict measures were taken by the 
German government. Public places such as shopping malls, restaurants, cinemas, hairdressers 
and cafes were closed down on March the 22nd. The government has declared a national curfew. 
Individuals were allowed to leave their living spaces only for certain activities; If they do not share 
the same house, work, play sports or go to the market, provided that they are not in groups of 
more than two people.


Face-to-face education at schools was not allowed, so remote education was started in all 
regions. 


Our confirmed cases so far have reached 1,242,253, 72.61% of these cases have recovered, 
1.66% deaths and the remainder are still infected. Some people are more likely to become 
seriously ill than others. People with disabilities, diabetes, cancer, chronic respiratory disease, 
cardiovascular disease are at higher risk, we call this group a "risk group". In order to reduce the 
loss of life, we applied stricter quarantine procedures to this group.


The virus mainly spreads from person to person. Therefore, we must avoid close contact with 
people. There should be 6 feet between yourself and other people. Since hygiene is very 
important to avoid Covid-19, your hand should be washed frequently with soap and water for 30 
seconds. If soap and water are not available, a hand sanitizer should be used, and touching your 
mouth and nose with unwashed hands should be avoided. Since Covid-19 is a respiratory 
disease, wearing a mask is vital. For this reason, we explained the ways of protection to our 
citizens and made some of them compulsory.


The vaccine developed by Biontech and Pfizer in our country is very effective against coronavirus. 
Production of the doses of our vaccine, which received positive results from all trials, started. 
Priority as Germany, Turkey and in the final phase of the vaccine include the European Union can 
be completed and the following instant access of any side effects not observed. The countries 
with which we have an agreement will also have reached the vaccine by the end of 2021.


As Germany, we think that we, as the whole world, should join hands in order to end this global 
epidemic as soon as possible.
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